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The pit-vipers of  Gloydius halys-intermedius complex are a group of medically important 
venomous snakes widespread in Asia.  The biochemistry  of  their venom components  were 
extensively  studied  during  the  last  decades.  However,  this  species  complex  has  been 
remarkable  by  very  complicated  taxonomy  till  recent  time.  It  raised  a  lot  of  confusion, 
especially  in  biomedical  and biochemical  publications.  We reviewed taxonomy, systematics 
and distribution of the members of the complex, based on our original and GenBank data on 
variability of mtDNA markers. Geographically broad sampling was achieved, including the type 
localities. The final dataset comprised of 186 individuals. 

The following species should be recognized based on combined genetic and morphological  
evidences. G.  caraganus:  steppe  and  semi-desert  zones  of  Kazakhstan  and  Uzbekistan, 
including northern areas of Kyrgyzstan and Turkmenistan;  G. caucasicus: Talysh, Elburz, and 
Kopet-Dag  mountains;  G.  changdaoensis:  Changshan  Islands  and  adjacent  mainland; G.  
cognatus:  from  east  Kyrgyzstan  and  Kazakhstan  to  central  and northeast  China,  including 
Mongolia and Russia (Republics of Altai and Tuva);  G. halys:  South Siberia (Russia), part of 
northeast Mongolia and northeast China; G. intermedius: Russain Far East, Korean peninsula, 
and northeast China;  G. rickmersi: known from Alai valley only (Kyrgyzstan); G. shedaoensis: 
Shedao Island and adjacent  mainland;  G.  stejnegery:  China (Beijing,  Liaoning,  Shaanxi  and 
Shanxi provinces). G. lijianlii must be synonymised with G. changdaoensis, while G. saxatilis is 
synonym of  G.  intermedius.  It  is  highly  recommended to use  molecular  markers  to assist 
morphological  identification  of  specimens  from  the  territories  potentially  inhabited  by 
multiple species of this diverse group. 
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Who is who in Gloydius complex? New insights from extended 
geographical sampling and consequences for venom biochem-

istry research
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